
This waiver applies to all events organized by Prep Select Sports LLC 

Liability Waiver 

The undersigned hereby, 

• I willingly assume all risks associated with my participation in these activities, fully 
comprehending that they may result in injury, including severe or fatal injuries. These risks may 
arise not only from my own actions, negligence, or inactions, but also from the actions, 
negligence, or inactions of others, the established rules of engagement, the facility's conditions, or 
the equipment employed. This encompasses any risks that might not be reasonably anticipated by 
Prep Select Sports LLC.

• I acknowledge that my involvement in these activities is entirely voluntary and that I am 
accepting personal responsibility for any damages resulting from injuries I might sustain.

• Without reservation, I hereby release, waive the right to sue, and consent to refrain from legal 
action against Prep Select Sports LLC, along with its officers, directors, administrators, agents, 
coaches, employees, and volunteers, as well as sponsoring agencies, sponsors, advertisers, Youth 
Athletic Associations, and Amateur Sports Commissions. This release pertains to any liability 
towards me, my heirs, and my next of kin, and encompasses claims or losses linked to injuries, 
including death, or property damage incurred while participating in any official or unofficial Prep 
Select Sports LLC activities, events, or competitions.

• I assume accountability for all medical expenses incurred, whether covered by insurance or not. 
In the event of an emergency, accident, or illness, I authorize ambulance transportation to the 
hospital. I also provide consent for physicians, athletic trainers, technicians, first aid personnel, 
nurses, and dentists to carry out necessary diagnostic, treatment, operative procedures, and x-rays. 
I understand that no assurances have been made regarding the outcomes of examination or 
treatment. I am fully responsible for all medical expenses incurred.

• I take responsibility for the decision to continue my participation even while recovering from 
injuries.

• I grant permission for the unrestricted use of my image, name, voice, or likeness without 
compensation for promotional, television, radio, or film coverage related to Prep Select Sports 
LLC. 




